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Purchasing Division: 1100 St. Francis Drive, Room 2016, Santa Fe, 87505; PO Box 6850, Santa Fe, NM  87502 (505) 827-0472 

 

 

 

State of New Mexico 

General Services Department 

Purchasing Division 

 

Price Agreement Amendment 
 

 

Awarded Vendor: 

2 Vendors: 

(AA) Dismuke Construction Company 

(AD) Sunland Asphalt  

 

Email:  

Telephone No.  

 Number:  00-80500-20-16825 

 

Amendment No.:  Two 

 

Term:  June 18, 2020 thru June 17, 2021 

   

Ship To: 

New Mexico Department of Transportation 

Various Locations 

  

Procurement Specialist:  Raelynn Lujan 

 

Telephone No.:  505-827-0484 

 

Email:  raelynn.lujan@state.nm.us 

Invoice: 

New Mexico Department of Transportation 

As Requested at Time of Order 

 

For questions regarding this contract please 

contact: 

  

Angela Martinez (505) 570-7940   

 

Title: Crack Sealing- How Mix Asphalt and Concrete Pavements 

 

This amendment is to be attached to the respective Price Agreement and become a part thereof. 

 

This amendment is issued to reflect the following effective immediately: 

 

See attached Current Price List. 

 

Except as modified by this amendment, the provisions of the Price Agreement shall remain in full force 

and effect. 

 

Accepted for the State of New Mexico 
 

 

/Purchasing_Agent/                                              Date: 

Mark Hayden, New Mexico State Purchasing Agent  

 

 

 

 

 

DocuSign Envelope ID: A9CE00DA-F08D-4EF0-8D74-2940AE4F758A

This Agreement was signed on behalf of the State Purchasing Agent

9/21/2020

X
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Purchasing Division: 1100 St. Francis Drive, Room 2016, Santa Fe, 87505; PO Box 6850, Santa Fe, NM  87502 (505) 827-0472 

 

00-80500-20-16825 

Amendment No. 2 

Page 2 
 

 

Awarded Items: 

Item Approx. 

Qty. 

Unit Article and Description   Unit Price 

      (AA) 

    Unit Price 

        (AD) 

1 20,000 LBS 

Routed Joint and Crack Sealing Type I (ASTM 

D6690) - Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt 

pavements. Statewide1 to 15,000 lbs 

$2.00 $1.90 

2 60,000 LBS 

Routed Joint and Crack Sealing Type I (ASTM 

D6690) - Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt 

pavements. Statewide Greater Than 15,000 to 50,000 

lbs 

$1.47 $1.69 

3 100,000 LBS 

Routed Joint and Crack Sealing Type I (ASTM 

D6690) - Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt 

pavements. Greater Than 50,000 lbs 
$1.37 $1.55 

4 20,000 LBS 

Routed Joint and Crack Sealing Type II  (ASTM 

D6690) - Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt 

pavements. Statewide1 to 15,000 lbs 
$2.05 $1.93 

5 60,000 LBS 

Routed Joint and Crack Sealing Type II  (ASTM 

D6690) - Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt 

pavements. Statewide Greater Than 15,000 to 50,000 

lbs 

$1.49 $1.71 

6 100,000 LBS 

Routed Joint and Crack Sealing Type II  (ASTM 

D6690) - Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt 

pavements. Statewide Greater Than 50,000 lbs 
$1.39 $1.58 

7 20,000 LBS 

Non-Routed Crack Sealing Type I (ASTM D6690)- 

Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt pavements. 

Statewide1 to 15,000 lbs 
$2.00 $1.66 

8 60,000 LBS 

Non-Routed Crack Sealing Type I (ASTM D6690)- 

Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt pavements. 

Statewide Greater Than 15,000 to 50,000 lbs 
$1.47 $1.55 

9 100,000 LBS 

Non-Routed Crack Sealing Type I (ASTM D6690)- 

Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt pavements. 

Statewide Greater Than 50,000 lbs 
$1.37 $1.46 

10 20,000 LBS 

Non-Routed Crack Sealing Type II (ASTM D6690) - 

Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt pavements. 

Statewide1 to 15,000 lbs 
$2.05 $1.70 

11 60,000 LBS 

Non-Routed Crack Sealing Type II (ASTM D6690) - 

Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt pavements. 

Statewide Greater Than 15,000 to 50,000 lbs $1.49 $1.59 

12 100,000 LBS 

Non-Routed Crack Sealing Type II (ASTM D6690) - 

Hot applied, for concrete and asphalt pavements. 

Statewide                                           Greater Than 

50,000 lbs     

$1.39 $1.49 

 
00-80500-20-16825 
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Item Approx. 

Qty. 

Unit Article and Description    Unit Price 

        (AA) 

   Unit Price 

       (AD) 

13 2,000 MI 

Mobilization Statewide - One way as defined within 

price agreement. $5.00 $12.00 

14 600 HR Traffic Control  - Per Approved TCP $150.00 $200.00 

15 600 HR 

Traffic Control Nightime Hours  - When Traffic 

control is required between the hours of 8pm to 5am 

per approved TCP 

$450.00 $350.00 

16 10,000 LF 

Sealing and Resealing Concrete Pavement Joints 

(ASTM D5893) - Cold applied Sealant for portland 

cement concrete pavements. Statewide1 to 5,000 L.F. 

$8.00 No Bid 

17 50,000 LF 

Sealing and Resealing Concrete Pavement Joints 

(ASTM D5893) - Cold applied Sealant for portland 

cement concrete pavements. Statewide Greater Than 

5,000 to 20,000 L.F. 

$4.50 No Bid 

18 100,000 LF 

Sealing and Resealing Concrete Pavement Joints 

(ASTM D5893) - Cold applied Sealant for portland 

cement concrete pavements. Statewide Greater Than 

20,000 L.F. 

$3.70 No Bid 

19 2,000 MI 
Mobilization Statewide - One way as defined within 

price agreement. $10.00 No Bid 

20 600 HR 
 

Traffic Control  - Per Approved TCP 
$300.00 No Bid 

 

*** 20 Awarded Items Total *** 
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Purchasing Division: 1100 St. Francis Drive, Room 2016, Santa Fe, 87505; PO Box 6850, Santa Fe, NM  87502 (505) 827-0472 

 

 

 

State of New Mexico 

General Services Department 

Purchasing Division 

 

Price Agreement Amendment 
 

 

Awarded Vendor: 

2 Vendors: 

(AA) Dismuke Construction Company 

(AD) Sunland Asphalt  

 

Email: nnicholson@sunlandasphalt.com 

Telephone No.  (505) 250-8654 
 

 Number:  00-80500-20-16825 

 

Amendment No.:  One 

 

Term:  June 18, 2020 thru June 17, 2021 

   

Ship To: 

New Mexico Department of Transportation 

Various Locations 

  

Procurement Specialist:  Raelynn Lujan 

 

Telephone No.:  505-827-0484 

 

Email:  raelynn.lujan@state.nm.us 

Invoice: 

New Mexico Department of Transportation 

As Requested at Time of Order 

 

For questions regarding this contract please 

contact: 

  

Angela Martinez- (505) 570-7940   

 

Title: Crack Sealing- How Mix Asphalt and Concrete Pavements 

 

This amendment is to be attached to the respective Price Agreement and become a part thereof. 

 

This amendment is issued to reflect the following effective immediately: 

 
Remove Vendors from Award: 

(AB) GM Emulsion LLC (AC) GME General Building LLC 

5935 Agua Fria Street 5935 Agua Fria Street 

Santa Fe, NM 87507 Santa Fe, NM 87507 

(505) 471-9981 (505) 471-9981 

erik@gmegeneralbuilding.com erik@gmegeneralbuilding.com 

 
Add Vendor to Award: 

(AD) 0000094246  

Sunland Asphalt 

5204 2nd NW 

Albuquerque, NM 87107 

(505) 250-8654 

nnicholson@sunlandasphalt.com 
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Purchasing Division: 1100 St. Francis Drive, Room 2016, Santa Fe, 87505; PO Box 6850, Santa Fe, NM  87502 (505) 827-0472 

 

Except as modified by this amendment, the provisions of the Price Agreement shall remain in full force 

and effect. 

 

Accepted for the State of New Mexico 
 

 

/Purchasing_Agent/                                              Date: 

Mark Hayden, New Mexico State Purchasing Agent  
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X

8/20/2020

This Agreement was signed on behalf of the State Purchasing Agent
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